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MID AUTUMN FESTIVAL PROGRESSIVE DRAWING RULES & REGULATIONS 
 

1. Date(s) and Time(s):    September 1 – 30, 2023  
 
Drawing Ticket Issuance:  September 1 at 6:00 a.m. – September 30, 2023 at 11:59 p.m. 
 
$1,000 Drawings Times:              9:00 a.m., 10:00 a.m., 12:00 p.m., 1:00 p.m., 2:00 p.m., 3:00 p.m.,  

4:00 p.m., 6:00 p.m., 7:00 p.m., 8:00 p.m., 10:00 p.m., 11:00 p.m.,  
12:00 a.m. and 1:00 a.m. 

 
Progressive Drawing Times:          11:00 a.m., 5:00 p.m., 9:00 p.m. and 2:00 a.m. 
 

2. Progressive drawing amount starts at $10,000. If the progressive drawing winner is not present, $10,000 
will be added after each progressive drawing until a winner is present. 
 

3. Promotions Participants are eligible to receive one manual drawing entry into that giveaway date’s 
drawings by receiving one of the qualifying hands.  

 
Game Qualifying Hand 

EZ Baccarat Dragon bonus hand is dealt (player must place a minimum table limit 

wager to be eligible) 

21st Century Blackjack Any Blackjack* 

Three Card Poker Straight or better 

Ultimate Texas Hold’em Straight or better 

Pai Gow Tiles Any pair or better 

Pai Gow Poker Red flush or better 

Omaha/Big O Four 10’s or better** 

Stud Four 6’s or better** 

Limit/No Limit Hold’em Black Flush** 

Casino War Any tie hand  

*excludes Blackjack Switch 

** Must use both hole cards 

 
4. The manual drawing entry for the giveaway date will be issued by a dealer. The Promotions Participant 

must completely fill out both halves of the manual drawing entry with their first and last name that matches 
his or her Government ID or Commerce Casino Players Card. 

 
5. The Promotion Participant will retain half of the ticket for their records and return the other half to the 

dealer. 
 
6. Promotions Participants are responsible for their manual drawing entries. Replacement manual drawing 

entries will not be issued. 
 
7. A Casino Representative will contact Surveillance to monitor the drawing.  
  
8. At the designated drawing time, a Casino Representative will draw by hand and remove one manual 

drawing entry from the drawing drum.  
 
9. Any incomplete or invalid manual drawing entry or foreign objects placed inside of the drum shall not be 

considered eligible. 

http://www.problemgambling.ca.gov/


GEGA-001163. Must be 21. Play Responsibly. Gambling Problem? Call 1-800-GAMBLER or visit www.problemgambling.ca.gov 

 

 

 
10. Throughout the casino, the winning manual drawing entry, drawing entry number and name will be 

displayed on the promotional television screens and announced.  
 
11. The winner(s) will have 5 minutes from time of the conclusion of the initial announcement to report to a 

Casino Representative at the place of the announcement.   
 
12. Winner(s) must be present to win. 
 
13. Once the winner(s) announce their presence he or she must present his or her matching manual drawing 

entry and valid photo identification or Commerce Casino Players Card within 3 minutes of checking in with 
the Casino Representative. If the drawing winner cannot produce, a valid photo identification or Players 
Card within the 3-minute period they will be determined ineligible as a drawing winner and another winner 
will be selected. 

 
14. If a winner is found to be related to a Commerce Casino employee or a relative of an employee (as defined 

in the Commerce Casino official rules) they will be determined ineligible as a drawing winner and another 
winner will be selected. 

 
15. $1,000 Drawing Process:  If a winner is not present the manual drawing entry will be placed back into the 

drum and the above process will be repeated up to 2 additional times (for a total of 3 times) or until a 
winner is found. If a winner cannot be found by conclusion of the 3rd time, there will be no winner for that 
drawing time. This process will conclude if all of the manual drawing vouchers are exhausted.  

 
16. Progressive Drawing Process: Only one ticket will be selected during each progressive drawing time. If 

there is no winner found, there will be no winner for that drawing time and the manual drawing entry will be 
placed back into the drum. The progressive prize amount rolls over to the next progressive drawing time 
and $10,000 will be added to the progressive amount. Once a progressive drawing is won all drawing 
tickets will be emptied from the drawing drum. 

 
17. Players may only win a maximum of one (1) $1,000 drawing prize and one (1) progressive drawing a day. 
 
18. No purchase necessary. See Casino Shift Manager for more details. 

 
THE COMMERCE CASINO & HOTEL (“COMMERCE”) OFFICIAL RULES & REGULATIONS 

 
1. Must be at least 21 years of age to participate and must provide valid proof of age, upon request. 
 
2. Individuals who are excluded from casino facilities, including through a government program, at Commerce 

Casino’s discretion, or by their own request, are not eligible. 
 
3. This promotion is subject to all applicable federal, state and local laws and regulations, including gaming, 

and all aspects of the promotion are subject to the approval of appropriate regulatory authorities. 
 

4. All entries are subject to review and verification. 
 
5. Winners must have valid photo identification (driver’s license, state identification card, or a current 

passport) in order to collect prize. If winner is not a U.S. citizen, a current passport or alien registration card 
is required. All out of state residents are subject to tax withholdings on all winnings. 

 
6. Winners agree to allow Commerce Casino the unconditional use of their name and likeness for 

promotions/advertising and announcements without compensation, consideration, notice, review, or 
consent, where permitted. 
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7. Winners are responsible for any and all taxes, licenses, registrations and other fees. 
 

8. All decisions regarding the interpretation of rules, eligibility, etc. for this promotion lie solely with Commerce 
Casino whose decisions are final. Where a situation arises which is not covered by these rules, Casino has 
the authority to render a judgment, including the imposition of a penalty or disqualification, in accordance 
with the best interests of the Promotion and the maintenance of its integrity. 

 
9. Commerce Casino reserves the right to modify or cancel this promotion at any time, for any reason. 
 
10. Commerce Casino may disqualify any participant for any prize based upon fraud, dishonesty, violation of 

promotional rules, theft or destruction or unauthorized access to or alterations or mutilations of entry 
materials, or other misconduct while on property or otherwise, whether or not related to this promotion, or 
as otherwise reasonable or necessary for Casino to comply with applicable statutes and regulations, in its 
sole and absolute discretion. 

 
11. Commerce Casino is not responsible for any electronic transmission errors or delays resulting in omission, 

interruption, deletion, defect, delay in operations or transmission, or for technical, hardware, software 
failures of any kind, lost or unavailable connections, fraud, incomplete, or delayed computer transmissions, 
whether caused by Commerce Casino users, or by any of the equipment or programming associated with 
or utilized in the promotion or by any technical or human error which may occur in the processing of 
submissions which may limit , restrict, or prevent a participant’s ability to participate in the promotion. 

 
12. If for any reason the promotion is not capable of running as planned, including infection by computer virus, 

tampering, unauthorized intervention, fraud, technical failures, government order or regulation, acts of God, 
or any other causes within or beyond the control of Commerce Casino which corrupt or affect the 
administration, security, fairness, integrity, or proper conduct of this promotion, Commerce Casino reserves 
the right at its sole discretion to cancel, terminate, modify or suspend the promotion. 

 
13. If applicable, all invitations, drawing tickets and offers are non-transferable. 
 
14. Directors and Officers, and all Employees of Commerce Casino and its affiliates or subsidiary companies 

and immediate family members are excluded from participation in this promotion. Immediate family is 
defined as: mother, father, spouse, brother, sister, children, son-in-law, daughter-in-law, mother-in-law, 
father-in-law, step-parents, step-children, grandmother, grandfather, grandchildren and any relative or 
other person residing in the employee’s place of residence. 

 
15. By participating in this promotion, participants agree to all rules. 
 
16. A copy of these rules and any changes will be available upon request at Casino Services throughout the 

duration of this promotion or by e-mailing marketing@commercecasino.net  
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